mmp27

From: James Thomas <randythomas@me.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 14, 2016 2:55 PM

To: Michael Pinckney ’

Subject: Re: Invoice 2921 from AIR-MODS AND REPAIR INC

i called the Mike and spoke with Shane. It's all good thank you
Sent from my iPhone

> On Apr 14, 2016, at 3:55 PM, Michael Pinckney <mmp27@cox.net> wrote:
> :
> This one will show that it has been paid by Pinckney.
>

> From: Dave Mathiesen - Air Mods [mailto:airmods1191@aol.com]
> Sent: Thursday, April 14, 2016 2:46 PM

> To: Randythomas@me.com

> Ce: MMP27@Cox.net

> Subject:.Invoice 2921 from AIR-MODS AND REPAIR INC

>

>

> Dear Randy Thomas :

>

> Your invoice is attached. Please remit payment at your earliest
> convenience.

>

> Thank you for your business - we appreciate it very much.

>

> Sincerely,

>

> AIR-MODS AND REPAIR INC

> 609-259-2400

>



